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Professorship 
in Clinical Chemistry 
 
The Department of Medical Biosciences invites applications for a position as 
professor in clinical chemistry. The department is affiliated to the Faculty of Medicine 
at Umea University. Our main tasks consist of research and education at 
undergraduate level, including supervision of postgraduate students. A wide range of 
high quality research projects are carried out by research groups who work closely 
with scientists from other clinical departments at the university. The common theme 
is the use of molecular approaches to study the mechanisms of biological processes 
involved in human disease. The department offers excellent support facilities. For 
more information about the department, please visit our website at: 
http://www.medbio.umu.se. 
 
The professorship includes clinical duties and the successful applicant will also work 
as a medical doctor within clinical chemistry at Laboratory Medicine, University 
Hospital of Northern Sweden. 
 
Qualifications 
 
For appointment as professor, the applicant, besides having a degree in medicine, 
must hold a doctoral degree or other equivalent scientific and academic skills that are 
relevant to the subject area.  
  
Documentation demonstrating teaching, academic and supervision skills within the 
field of clinical chemistry must be provided. 
 
For further information about the position, application guidelines, and information 
about how to submit the required application documentation, please visit the 
following websites:  
http://www8.umu.se/umu/aktuellt/arkiv/lediga_tjanster/311-991-12.html 
http://www.medfak.umu.se/english/instr-professor-m-fl/?languageId=1. 
 
Closing date for application is 31st January 2013 
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Senior University Lecturer  
in Clinical Chemistry 
 
The Department of Medical Biosciences invites applications for a position as Senior 
University Lecturer in clinical chemistry. The department is affiliated to the Faculty 
of Medicine at Umea University. Our main tasks consist of research and education at 
undergraduate level, including supervision of postgraduate students. A wide range of 
high quality research projects are carried out by research groups who work closely 
with scientists from other clinical departments at the university. The common theme 
is the use of molecular approaches to study the mechanisms of biological processes 
involved in human disease. The department offers excellent support facilities. For 
more information about the department, please visit our website at: 
http://www.medbio.umu.se. 
 
The lectureship includes clinical duties and the successful applicant will also work as 
a medical doctor within clinical chemistry at Laboratory Medicine, University 
Hospital of Northern Sweden. 
 
Qualifications 
 
For appointment as a senior university lecturer, the applicant, besides having a 
degree in medicine, must hold a doctoral degree or other equivalent scientific and 
academic skills that are relevant to the subject area.  
  
Documentation demonstrating teaching, academic and supervision skills within the 
field of clinical chemistry must be provided. 
 
For further information about the position, application guidelines, and information 
about how to submit the required application documentation, please visit the 
following websites:  
http://www8.umu.se/umu/aktuellt/arkiv/lediga_tjanster/312-992-12.html 
http://www.medfak.umu.se/english/instr-professor-m-fl/?languageId=1. 
 
Closing date for application is 31st January 2013 


